

1155 Brewery Park Blvd, Ste 200 Detroit, Michigan 48207 313-446-1530 Tax I.D. 38-1879991 July 15, 2025

Invoice 647655

Charles Widmaier Tyrone Township 123 Brighton Lake Rd., Ste. 205 Brighton, MI 48116

Re: In Re: Chris Ropeta

Claim #:

Client 8126 Matter 1

For Legal Services Rendered Through 6/30/2025

Date	Timekpr	Description of Services Performed	Hours
06/02/25	IJG	Correspondence to Township Clerk and Attorney regarding detailed court order regarding show cause	.20
06/02/25	JJG	Review and analysis of detailed court order regarding show cause	.30
06/03/25	BTIGA	Call with client and John Gillooly, discussing the case and next steps and compliance with the court's order.	.40
06/03/25	BTIGA	Analyze plaintiff's complaint and arguments with notes on what standards and cases plaintiff is using in support of arguments in advance of client call and with notes for eventual response brief.	.70
06/03/25	JJG	Correspondence to Township Attorney with a copy of court order as requested	.10
06/03/25	IJG	Conference call with Township Attorney and Township Clerk regarding court order and necessary compliance with the court order	.40
06/20/25	IJG	Correspondence from / to Township Attorney regarding entire record being submitted to court	.20
06/20/25	JJG	Preliminary review of entire record of Township Board meeting to be filed with court	.50
06/20/25	JJG	Preliminary review and analysis of record of public hearing forwarded by township Attorney Widmaier	.70
06/23/25	BTIGA	Analyze cases cited by plaintiff in complaint relating to the removal of office for conduct not specifically related to official acts with notes on potential arguments or distinguishing factors for this case.	.70
06/23/25	BTIGA	Analyze cases generally discussing analogous situations of removal from office and the standards that courts employ in review of a quasi-tribunal as in this case with plaintiff's removal with notes for superintending control response brief.	.90
06/24/25	WDUFF	Reviewed and analyzed Order to Show Cause Regarding Complaint for Superintending Control for purpose of analyzing procedural posture and assessing potential response strategies.	.30
		Total Walna of Samiaga	<u>5.40</u>
		Total Value of Services	<u>\$1,852.50</u>

In Re: Chris Ropeta 07/15/25

Time Summary by Timekeeper	Hours	Amount
Benjamin Tigay	2.70	945.00
John J. Gillooly	2.40	840.00
William Duffield	0.30	67.50

Costs Advanced:

Date	Description	Amount
	Total Costs Advanced	\$ 0.00
	Total Due This Invoice	\$1,852,50

Invoices for legal services are due upon receipt. To ensure proper application of your payment, please indicate our invoice number and client/matter number on your remittance.